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What’s the Point? 
by Paul Kolberg 

 
About the book: 
 
In times of crisis, we all ask “What’s the point?”. There is only one point in living but it may not 
be what you think. It turns out the answer to the question is hidden in plain sight and is 
connected to the fundamental purpose and essence of our existence. 
 
Uniting against COVID-19: 
 
Marmalade Publishing and Paul Kolberg have agreed to donate fifty percent (50%) of royalties 
from the sale of this book to help fight against Coronavirus (COVID-19). Your valued 
contribution will be used by registered charities and foundations to identify potential treatments 
and to accelerate their development. 
 
About the author: 
 
Paul Kolberg was born in England to a mother of Irish parentage and a father of Prussian 
ancestry. He is the author of Jesus and Kabbalah – The Lost Kingdom (which reached #1 on 
Amazon in three categories) and Meditations in a Crisis. For over twenty-five years, Paul 
practised and travelled throughout the world as a lawyer. Using his strong analytical and 
communication skills, Paul makes complicated topics and concepts easy to understand. In the 
past, Paul has regularly written legal and topical articles for various magazines but in 2014, he 
became a professional author, playwright and screenwriter. Paul has written one further book that 
is in the process of publication, as well as three plays, one of which has been recorded for radio 
and is in post-production. 
 
Critics & Reviews: 
 
Reviewed by Foluso Falaye for Readers’ Favorite 
 
Why do bad things happen? Why is there pain and suffering in the world? What is the point in 
trying when all these negative forces exist, lurking around to slam the door in your face at every 
chance? If you have been contemplating these questions, What’s the Point? aims to help you find 
answers. Paul Kolberg dives into the concepts of life and existence, pain and pleasure, love and 
ego, selflessness and selfishness, and lots more, and finally arrives at a conclusion: a recipe for a 
positive and fulfilled mindset in an imperfect world. What’s the Point? Finding Hope in a Crisis 
makes use of logical arguments and prompts readers to think outside their present realities; it 
requires an open mind and a quiet space to reflect.  
 
What’s he Point? Finding Hope in a Crisis is straight to the point; the answers are not hidden in 
layers of mysterious philosophical concepts but presented with points that are easy to assimilate. 
These points have helped me to think further and look deeper into some life concepts, triggering 
insights that I was able to discover by myself. Paul Kolberg makes it clear from the beginning that 
religion is not included. Apparently, the things we have been told are not necessarily true. But 
there are some facts that are easy to see and can be proved with science. From these facts, we can 
arrive at conclusions and solutions that could make the world a better place. Paul Kolberg's book 
is a blessing in this pandemic period. What’s the Point? projects ways to find hope and love in 
troubling times. We need more books like this, especially now.” 
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